
Wealth System
The 2cash Wealth System guide will show you how leverage cryptocurrency, 

utility tokens and NFTs to design the financial future that you want.
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1 create your 2cash 
wallet account

Create your free account at 
www.2cash.io using the promo 
code of the person who invited 
you.

2

Use your account number as 
your promo code and invite 
others. Get 2cash token airdrops 
on everyone you refer.

3

Acquire cryptocurrency at the 
best market rates. Transfer funds, 
buy NFT’s and pay bills.

4

Get paid to trade Bitcoin and 
cryptocurrency plus 2cash 
tokens.

invite others

2cash wallet 
transactions

2cash wealth creation

1 subscribe to the AC20

Enjoy unlimited 2cash wallet 
transactions with zero fees.

2

Earn 20% direct bonus on 
everyone you invite, plus 
overrides on everyone they invite.

3

Use your promo code to invite 5 
others who subscribe to the 
AC20 and help each of them to 
invite 5.

rewards income

invite 5 new members

 

1 accept 2cash

Generate 2cash snippets or QR 
codes to accept 2cash on any 
website or mobile app.

2

Promote your products and 
services to the continuous 
growing 2cash network.

3

Provide online payment solutions 
for products and services.

2cash network

payment solutions

1 initial exchange offering

Participate in the TWO 
cryptocurrency exchange 
offering and earn rewards 
inviting other participants.

2

Purchase 2cash utility tokens 
with 2pack orders to use in the 
2cash ecosystem or trade on 
crypto exchanges.

2cash tokens
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